DONNA JONES

POLICE & CRIME
COMMISSIONER

HAMPSHIRE & ISLE OF WIGHT

Our Reference: HA5849

Date: 17" June 2024

-

Your request under Freedom of Information Act (FOIA)

Thank you for contacting the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner
requesting information. Your request was dated 20" May 2024, has been given the

reference HA5849.

Responses:

Request

Response

Please provide the following
information for your Domestic Abuse
Perpetrator Programme for the
2022/2023 Financial Year

1. The Name/Title/Scope of the
commissioned programme in your
area including programmes
designed for male victims that
accept/engage/support females

The OPCC did not directly commission
Domestic Abuse Perpetrator Programmes
in 2022/23, with the exception of CARA
(Cautioning and Relationship Abuse) (an
awareness raising an out of court
intervention for individuals using abusive
behaviours in their intimate and non-
intimate relationships). However, the OPCC
contributed funding to the Local Authority
contracts that deliver Domestic Abuse
Perpetrator Programmes. Therefore, the
individual submitting the request may wish
to contact the Local Authority directly for
further information.

Hampshire and Southampton — Perpetrator
Services (Hampshire and Southampton) —
Hampton Trust provide the service and
deliver the ADAPT (Accredited Domestic
Abuse Prevention Training) programme
accepting referrals for residents of
Hampshire and Southampton age 16 and
above (not going through the Criminal
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Justice System) using abusive behaviours
in an intimate relationship

Portsmouth — Integrated Domestic Abuse
Service for residents of Portsmouth — Stop
Domestic Abuse provide the service and
deliver Portsmouth City Councils Up2U:
Creating Healthy Relationships programme
as part of the integrated contract. The
service provides specialist support to anyone
(men, women or non-binary) aged 16 and
over who acknowledge they use abusive or
unhealthy behaviours within their
relationship and want to change and who are
not going through the criminal justice system
for domestic abuse.

IOW - Integrated Domestic Abuse and
Sexual Crime Service — Hampton Trust were
subcontracted by You Trust to provide the
perpetrator element of this contract. They
delivered ADAPT. Over 18 years, not in the
Criminal Justice Service.

2. The total number of females
who self-referred into the
programme

Hampshire — we do not hold this information

Southampton — we do not hold this
information

Portsmouth - we do not hold this
information

IOW - we do not hold this information

3. The total number of self-
referred females who were accepted
onto the programme

Hampshire — we do not hold this information

Southampton — we do not hold this
information

Portsmouth - we do not hold this
information

IOW - we do not hold this information

4. The total number of self-
referred females who have
completed the programme

Hampshire — we do not hold this information

Southampton — we do not hold this
information

Portsmouth - we do not hold this
information

IOW - we do not hold this information
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5. The total number of females
referred by an agency (e.g., police,
social service etc.) into the
programme

Hampshire — Total females referred 32 (this
includes self-referrals and agency referrals)

Southampton — Total females referred 12
(this includes self-referrals and agency
referrals)

Portsmouth - Total females referred 3 (this
includes self-referrals and agency referrals)

IOW - Total females referred 5 (this
includes self-referrals and agency referrals)

6. The total number of referred
females who were accepted on to
the programme

Hampshire — we do not hold this information

Southampton — we do not hold this
information

Portsmouth - we do not hold this
information

IOW - we do not hold this information

7. The total number of referred
females who have completed the
programme

Hampshire — 2

Southampton - 0

Portsmouth - 0

IOW — Numbers do not separate by gender

8. The names of the organisations
who have made a referral to the
programme

Police, Social Care children, Social Care
adults, Self, Victim Service, CAFCASS,
Project Foundation, Solicitor, Family
Safeguarding Service, Society of St James,
Health Visitor, CAPA, Mental Health team,
Relate, Probation, other — however please
note this could be for male, female, non-
binary etc

Link to evaluation of programme
efficacy:

PowerPoint Presentation (cumbria.ac.uk) —
Portsmouth City Council should be
approached for the report referenced in this
presentation which we believe is
unpublished

ADAPT — we do not hold this information

9. Financial Contributors:
(Inclusive of Statutory, Non-
Statutory Organisations and
individual voluntary donations)

Hampshire and Southampton — Police and
Crime Commissioner contribution -
£70,000; Hampshire County Council &
Southampton City Council (core) - £140,000
— however the Local Authority would need
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to be approached for any additional funding
given in this financial year

Portsmouth — Police and Crime
Commissioner contribution - £20,000 -
however the Local Authority would need to
be approached for any additional funding
given in this financial year

IOW - Police and Crime Commissioner
contribution - £20,000 - however the Local
Authority would need to be approached for
any additional funding given in this financial

year
10. Budget inclusive of Running We do not hold this information as it is a
Costs Local Authority Contract, which in two areas

was an integrated contract

If you are unhappy with the way this request has been handled or the decision made,
you have the right to require the Office of the Police and Crime Commissioner for
Hampshire to review the decision. Complaints should be made in writing using the
email address: opcc@hampshire.pnn.police.uk . If you are unhappy with the
outcome of the review, you can contact the Information Commissioner. Contact
details can be found by visiting the website: https:/ico.org.uk/

Yours Sincerely

Sarah Moon
Complaints and Data Protection Manager
Office of Police and Crime Commissioner Hampshire and Isle of Wight
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